Westmorland and Furness Council
Freedom of Information Act (FOIA) 2000
Request for information relating to Grisedale Croft Care Home, Alston
FOI-208440-2026


1. The full Cabinet report, all appendices, and all impact assessments (Equality Impact Assessment, Integrated Impact Assessment, and any Data Protection Impact Assessment) relating to the decision taken by Cabinet on 21 April 2026 concerning the future of Grisedale Croft Care Home, Alston, to the extent that any of these are not already published on the Council's website.

Attached is a copy of -
The Cabinet report
The Equality Impact Assessment (EIA) report


2. All versions of the options appraisal considered by officers (including drafts prepared for the Directorate Management Team, Corporate Management Team or any officer board) relating to the future of Grisedale Croft, from 1 April 2023 to date.

Attached is a copy of -
The CMT report


3. Any legal advice, or a summary of legal advice, placed before Cabinet concerning the Council's duties under the Care Act 2014, the Equality Act 2010 and the Human Rights Act 1998 in relation to this decision, so far as it can lawfully be disclosed.

Please see Cabinet report, provided in Q1.


4. Minutes, redacted as necessary, of any Cabinet, Leadership Team, Corporate Management Team or officer board meeting from 1 January 2025 onwards at which the future of Grisedale Croft was discussed.

The disclosure of the Minutes of the CMT meeting regarding the future of Grisedale Croft, is refused under Section 36(2)(c) of FOIA, in that they would otherwise prejudice the effective conduct of public affairs.

Section 36 is a qualified exemption, and the Council has therefore considered whether the public interest in maintaining the exemption outweighs the public interest in disclosure. The Public Interest Test is as follows –

Factors in favour of disclosure -
Allows an increasing public understanding of the council’s decision-making processes
It promotes transparency and accountability
And shows how the council manages its finances

Factors in favour of withholding the information –
It protects the ability of colleagues to provide free and frank advice
And thus, prevents a Chilling Effect on internal discussions
It allows for an effective and robust decision-making processes
It also avoids unnecessary harm based on the release of internal discussions and ideas

The public interest in providing the information has been carefully weighed against any prejudice to the public interest that might arise from withholding the information.

In considering all these factors, it is concluded that in all the circumstances of this case, the public interest in maintaining the exemption outweighs the public interest in disclosing the requested information.

This response therefore serves as a formal refusal notice under Section 17 of the Freedom of Information Act.

The Cabinet Minutes  for Tuesday the 21st April 2026, are available on the Council’s website here -
https://westmorlandandfurness.moderngov.co.uk/ieListDocuments.aspx?CId=223&MId=14096&Ver=4


5. At 31 March of each year from 2020 to the latest available year: the number of registered beds at Grisedale Croft, the number of beds open for admission, the number of permanent residents, and the number of respite and intermediate-care / step-down residents.
	Occupancy

	As at (Date)
	Registered Beds
	Available
	Permanent 
	Short Term
	Total

	31 March 2024
	13
	12
	8
	0
	8

	31 March 2025
	13
	12
	4
	1
	5

	31 March 2026
	13
	12
	4
	1
	5



6. For registered manager, deputy manager, senior care workers and care workers at Grisedale Croft: the budgeted full-time-equivalent establishment, the actual FTE in post, and the vacancy rate, at 31 March of each year from 2020 to the latest available year.

	 
	31/03/2024
	31/03/2025
	31/03/2026

	 
	Budget
	Actual
	Budget
	Actual
	Budget
	Actual

	 
	FTE
	FTE
	FTE
	FTE
	FTE
	FTE

	Registered Manager
	                      fewer than 5 
	                     fewer than 5
	                      fewer than 5
	                      fewer than 5
	                      fewer than 5
	                      fewer than 5

	Supervisor
	                      fewer than 5
	                      fewer than 5
	                      fewer than 5
	                      fewer than 5
	fewer than 5
	                      fewer than 5

	Night Support Worker
	                      fewer than 5
	                      fewer than 5
	                      fewer than 5
	                      fewer than 5
	                      fewer than 5
	                      fewer than 5

	Support Worker
	                      7.3


	7.7
 
	7.3
	8.8
	7.3 
	7.7

	Cook
	                      fewer than 5
	                      fewer than 5
	                      fewer than 5
	                      fewer than 5
	                      fewer than 5
	                      fewer than 5

	Domestic
	                      fewer than 5
	                      fewer than 5
	                      fewer than 5
	                      fewer than 5
	                      fewer than 5
	                      fewer than 5



In the table above, where a figure is fewer than 5, it has been withheld and replaced with ‘fewer than 5’ to prevent the potential identification of individuals. This is in line with Section 40(2) of FOIA (personal data exemption) and UK GDPR guidance.


Support Worker Vacancies

	GRISEDALE CROFT
	Total Number of Vacant Posts
	0 Hour 
Vacancies
	Vacant Hours

	31 March 2024
	3
	1
	37.69

	31 March 2025
	4
	1
	61.75

	31 March 2026
	0
	0
	0




7. For each financial year from 2020/21 to the latest closed year: the total gross running cost of Grisedale Croft; the total income (broken down by Council-funded residents, self-funders, NHS-funded residents, other); and the net cost per occupied bed-day, calculated on the same basis as the Council uses for its other in-house homes.

Attached is a copy of -
The gross running costs

Please note, Parkview Gardens Residential Home has 36 beds for residential care, and the remainder beds are used for intermediate care.


8. The per-occupied-bed-day net cost figures for each of the Council's other in-house residential homes for the same years, for comparison.

Please see response to Q7.


9. For each financial year from 2020/21 to the latest closed year: the number of referrals received for admission to Grisedale Croft, broken down by referrer (Council social worker, Council Discharge to Assess team, Council commissioning team, NHS Discharge to Assess, self-funder enquiry, other) and by outcome (admitted, offered and declined, not offered).

Westmorland and Furness Council does not hold the requested information in a recorded format that can be readily extracted. While some relevant information may exist, it is not held within a central recording system. Instead, it is dispersed across individual email accounts and managed through manual processes. There is no consolidated dataset or report currently in existence that captures the information you have requested. We therefore estimate that the cost of complying with your request would exceed the appropriate limit, specified in regulations for Local Government, of £450.

The cost limit under Section 12 is 18 hours of work for local authorities. Based on our calculations that means the work needed to locate, retrieve and extract the relevant information for your request would be just over 185 days (roughly 3 hours per record x 1452 records = 4,356 hours, or 181.5 days)

As the time taken to review each record could vary due to level of detail recorded, this figure could be higher.

Under section 12 of the FOI Act the council is not obliged to comply with your request due to the excessive cost of providing you with a response. However, the council will consider a revised request should you chose to submit one.

We can confirm that the service does not accept direct referrals from self-funders. As such, we would not hold referral data relating to this group.


10. Any internal policy or guidance issued to Council social workers, hospital discharge teams, brokerage staff or commissioning staff concerning the use of Grisedale Croft, from 1 April 2023 onwards.

The Council does not hold a specific internal policy or formal guidance document issued to social workers, hospital discharge teams, brokerage staff or commissioning staff concerning the use of Grisedale Croft from 1 April 2023 onwards.


11. Confirmation of whether Grisedale Croft has at any time since 1 April 2023 been excluded from the Council's preferred-provider list, step-down bed contract, Discharge to Assess framework, or equivalent commissioning vehicle; and if so, the reasons.

Grisedale Croft has not been excluded at any time since 1 April 2023 from the Council’s preferred provider list, step-down bed contract, Discharge to Assess framework, or any equivalent commissioning arrangements.


12. The most recent building condition survey and any stock condition report for Grisedale Croft (and any preceding report since 2018), together with any engineers' or architects' assessments of whether the building can be refurbished or extended.

Information not held by Westmorland and Furness Council.

13. Any feasibility study, site-search report, options appraisal, or correspondence with potential site owners concerning the Council's stated preferred option of providing alternative accommodation in a suitable building in the local area, including (a) the geographic search radius, (b) the sites considered, (c) cost estimates, (d) a timetable, and (e) the source of capital funding.

The Council can confirm that it does not hold any recorded information in scope of this request. No feasibility study, site-search report, options appraisal, or correspondence with potential site owners has been undertaken to date in relation to the provision of alternative accommodation in a suitable building in the local area.

Consequently, the Council does not hold information relating to (a) a defined geographic search radius, (b) sites considered, (c) cost estimates, (d) a delivery timetable, or (e) identified sources of capital funding.

If any correspondence was to be held with potential site owners, it would be considered exempt from disclosure under Section 43(2) of the Freedom of Information Act 2000 (FOIA) relating to Commercial Interest, S.43(2) considers that the disclosure would be likely to prejudice the commercial interests of any person (including the public authority holding it).

Section 43(2) of FOIA, is a qualified exemption and requires that a public interest test be done. Should any information be held and requested in the future, a public interest test would be undertaken as required, to ascertain whether the public would be best served by the disclosure or the withholding of any such information.


14. Confirmation of whether the Council has ruled out a new-build facility on or adjacent to the existing Grisedale Croft site; and if so, the reasons and supporting evidence.

Please see below link to the Council’s website , regarding the consultation document for Grisedale Croft -
https://www.westmorlandandfurness.gov.uk/westmorland-and-furness-council-news/2026/council-launches-consultations-future-two-care-homes


15. Any correspondence since 1 April 2023 between the Council and Homes England, the Department of Health and Social Care, NHS North East and North Cumbria ICB, NHS Lancashire and South Cumbria ICB, or any other body, regarding capital funding for replacement adult social care provision on Alston Moor.

The Council can confirm that it does not hold any recorded information within the scope of this request. No correspondence has taken place since 1 April 2023 between the Council and Homes England, the Department of Health and Social Care, NHS North East and North Cumbria ICB, NHS Lancashire and South Cumbria ICB, or any other body regarding capital funding for replacement adult social care provision on Alston Moor.


16. For each financial year from 2020/21 to the latest completed year, the number of Westmorland and Furness residents aged 65 or over whose home address was within the Alston Moor parish and who had a Discharge to Assess (Pathway 2) placement in a bedded setting after discharge from hospital. For each placement, in aggregate form to protect privacy: the care home used or category, the distance by road from Alston, and the duration of the Pathway 2 stay.

The Council has identified that the number of individuals falling within the scope of this request is fewer than five. Given the very small numbers involved and the specific geographic area referenced, there is a risk that individuals could be identified, even from aggregated data.

Therefore the data held in response to Q16 is refused under Section 40(2)(a) of FOIA as it contains personal data. To disclosure this information would breach the data protection principles under UK GDPR, as individuals could be identified and would therefore not reasonably expect this information to be made public.

As section 40 is an absolute exemption under FOIA, it does not require a public interest test.


17. For the same cohort, the number offered Grisedale Croft as an option and the number for whom Grisedale Croft was not offered, with the recorded reason where available.

Please see response to Q16.


18. The Council's internal policy or guidance document setting out how Discharge to Assess Pathway 2 placements are allocated between in-house and independent providers, and any specific guidance relating to Alston Moor residents.

The Council does not hold a specific internal policy or formal guidance document setting out how Discharge to Assess (Pathway 2) placements are allocated between in-house and independent providers, or any specific guidance relating to Alston Moor residents.

However, operationally, Discharge to Assess Pathway 2 referrals for North Cumbria Integrated Care NHS Foundation Trust (NCIC) are received via email from the Hospital Brokerage Team (Cumberland) into the Care Services Support Team. Where bed capacity is available, the relevant residential home is contacted to arrange an assessment. Referrals from University Hospitals of Morecambe Bay NHS Foundation Trust (UHMB) are submitted via Strata to the local authority.


19. The Council's most recent estimate of the current number of Alston Moor residents who (a) receive a residential or nursing placement funded wholly or partly by the Council, and (b) receive a home-care package funded wholly or partly by the Council; by age band (18-64, 65-74, 75-84, 85+) and by whether the placement or package is inside or outside the Alston Moor parish.

The Council has identified that the number of individuals falling within the scope of this request is fewer than five. Given the very small numbers involved and the specific geographic area referenced, there is a risk that individuals could be identified, even from aggregated data.

For further explanation, please see the response provided under Q16 (refusal under Section 40(2)(a) of FOIA).


20. The Council's projection of need for residential, dementia, respite and intermediate-care bed-days on Alston Moor over the next 5, 10 and 20 years, and the assumptions underlying the projection.

The Council’s current projections are produced at a higher‑level aggregation and are intended to support strategic planning and decision‑making. They are not broken down to the level of detail requested, and no separate modelling or projections are produced for individual areas at this scale.


21. Any Joint Strategic Needs Assessment extract or Public Health analysis specific to Alston Moor and older people.

Below is a link to Westmorland and Furness Summary Joint Strategic Needs Assessment -
https://www.cumbriaobservatory.org.uk/wp-content/uploads/2026/03/Summary-JSNA-June-24-v2-FINAL.pdf

Most of the data requested is not held at this level of granularity.


22. The Equality Impact Assessment completed to inform the Cabinet decision of 21 April 2026 concerning Grisedale Croft, in full and unredacted save where redaction is legally required.

EIA part of Q1, the Cabinet report.


23. Any preceding Equality Impact Assessment drafts produced during the development of the proposal.

One EIA has been produced.
Please note that the EIA will continue be updated during the consultation period.


24. Any internal analysis or briefing considering the impact of the proposal on residents, their families and carers with protected characteristics under the Equality Act 2010, particularly age and disability (including dementia).

EIA part of Q1, the Cabinet report.


25. A description of the consultation methods the Council will use to engage residents of Grisedale Croft who lack capacity, and any independent advocacy that will be provided, including the provider of that advocacy.

This is detailed in the consultation document for Grisedale Croft.

Westmorland and Furness Councils commissioned Advocacy Provider is N-Compass. It is N-Compass who will be providing Independent Mental Capacity Advocacy (IMCA) and Independent Mental Health Advocacy (IMHA) for those residents who are in receipt of this service.


26. Any Rural Proofing assessment undertaken in relation to this proposal (as recommended by Defra's Rural Proofing Guidance).

Covered in the EIA in Q1.
